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ABSTRACT

Backgroud:
Epidemiological studies have revealed the
association of oral diseases with sarcopenia or its
diagnostic factors (low muscle strength, low
muscle mass and reduced physical performance).
However, it remains unclear whether dental caries
is an independent predictor of sarcopenia or one
of its diagnostic factors. Hence the aim of this
study was to investigate the associations of dental
caries with sarcopenia and its diagnostic factors.

Method:
This cross-sectional study included a total of
1,961 participants aged 18-80. The Decayed,
Missing, and Filled teeth (DMFT) index was used
for assessing severe dental caries. The
independent variables related to dental caries
include DMFT index, severe dental caries and
tooth loss caused by caries. Severe dental caries
was defined as DMFT index over 8. Low muscle
strength was assessed by hand grip force. Low
muscle mass was assessed by dual-energy X-ray
absorptiometry (DXA) scan. Sarcopenia was
defined as the presence of both low muscle mass
and low muscle strength. Multivariate logistic
regression models was used to analyse the
associations of dental caries with sarcopenia and
its diagnostic factors.

Results:
In the fully adjusted models, dental caries was
positively associated with sarcopenia (DMFT
index: P-value=0.001; severe dental caries: odds
ratio[OR], 1.67; 95% confidence interval [CI],
1.13-2.46; tooth loss: P-value=0.002), low muscle

strength (DMFT index: P-value<0.001; severe
dental caries: OR, 1.66; 95% CI, 1.29-2.13; tooth
loss: P-value<0.001), and reduced physical
performance (DMFT index: P-value=0.001;
severe dental caries: OR, 1.71; 95% CI, 1.17-2.48;
tooth loss: P-value=0.001). Dental caries related
variables were not related to low muscle mass in
all models. The relationship of dental caries and
sarcopenia was more pronounced in the male
group.

Conclusions:
Dental caries can be an independent predictor of
sarcopenia and its diagnostic factors except low
muscle mass. This association remained in male
subgroup and partly remained in female subgroup.
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